
Aveleda

Vinho Verde Alvarinho 2023

SIZE 75cl

VINTAGE 2023

ABV 12.5%

GRAPE VARIETIES Alvarinho (100%)

CLOSURE Screw cap

SKU CODE L9146123

EXPRESSION White, Aromatic and 
Dry

COUNTRY Portugal

REGION Vinho Verde

ALLERGENS Sulphur

SUITABLE FOR Vegans, Vegetarians

CLOSURE Screw cap

PH 3.4

TOTAL ACIDITY 6g/l Tartaric

RESIDUAL SUGAR 3g/l

SKU L9146123

WHITE 
STILL WINE

PORTUGAL VINHO VERDE SUITABLE 
FOR VEGANS

TASTING NOTE

Clear appearance, pale lemon-yellow color 
with golden hints. Aveleda Alvarinho presents 
delicate aromas of grapefruit, orange leaf and 
white flowers. It is a very balanced and 
elegant white wine, surprisingly structured 
and velvety, with delicious notes of orange 
peel, pineapple and orange blossom. This 
wine presents a good acidity and depth in the 
mouth.

VINIFICATION

A unique varietal from the Alvarinho grape in 
the Vinho Verde wine region, known for its 
balance and character. Night harvesting 
ensures the grapes' freshness and aroma. At 
the vinification centre, the grapes undergo 
soft pressing and controlled fermentation, 
followed by aging in stainless steel vats and 
bottling.

FOOD MATCHING

Seafood Delight: Bright acidity enhances 
oysters, tuna, and shrimps.Creamy Harmony: 
Perfect with vegs au gratin or buttery 
asparagus.Cheese Companion: Vibrant 
acidity complements cheeses.


