
Quinta Do Crasto

Vinha Maria Teresa 2019

SIZE 75cl

VINTAGE 2019

ABV 14.5%

GRAPE VARIETIES Blend of indigenous 
grapes (100%)

CLOSURE Natural Cork

SKU CODE 37046219

EXPRESSION Red, Richly Textured 
and Full-Bodied

COUNTRY Portugal

REGION Douro

ALLERGENS Sulphur

SUITABLE FOR Vegans, Vegetarians

CLOSURE Natural Cork

SKU 37046219

RED STILL WINE PORTUGAL DOURO SUITABLE 
FOR VEGANS

TASTING NOTE

This multi-variety red from centenarian vines, 
created to celebrate the estate's 400th 
birthday and made only in outstanding 
vintages, is really something special: full of 
dark fruit, rocks and schist, with dizzying 
aromas of wild forest flowers, white pepper 
and dark chocolate.

VITICULTURE

Vinha Maria Teresa, a plot at Quinta do 
Crasto with century-old vines, yields 
concentrated fruit. Named after the founder's 
grandchild, it's a complex gem produced in 
select vintages. The PatGen Vineyards 
project preserves its terroir by identifying and 
genetically conserving 45 grape varieties, 
securing this exceptional 4.7-hectare plot for 
generations.

VINIFICATION

Grapes from Vinha Maria Teresa at Quinta do 
Crasto hand-inspected and foot-trodden in a 
stone tank. Transferred to an open stainless 
steel tank with robotic pistons for 7-day 
fermentation under controlled temperature.

FOOD MATCHING

The ideal partner for hearty beef and lamb 
dishes or blue cheeses.


